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Abstract 
 
Communities in the Midwest region have been experiencing demographic changes associated with a 
growing Latino population and an out-migration of the non-Latino population. These demographic 
changes have an impact on places and people and are linked to local social and economic conditions. The 
economic restructuring in the Midwest also had devastating effects on people, families, and communities, 
exacerbating old wounds of inequality and economic hardships. Racial/ethnic minorities are 
disproportionately affected by these structural economic changes—they have on average lower levels of 
education, lower access to employment, and lower wages, all of which contribute to higher levels of 
poverty. Using a multilevel framework, this study investigates the integrated influences of race/ethnicity, 
location, and local opportunity structures on household poverty. Data are drawn from the 2005–2007 
American Community Survey Public Use Microdata Sample data for the individual and household 
characteristics and from the American Community Survey Summary Files for labor market area 
characteristics. Results indicate that racial/ethnic minorities remain disproportionately disadvantaged in 
terms of household poverty. The odds of poverty are largely the result of differences in residential 
location and local labor market area socioeconomic and opportunity structures, net of the effects of 
individual and household characteristics, such as education, household structure, and industry of 
employment. These findings imply that improving the local labor market opportunity structures—i.e., 
creating and keeping good jobs in the Midwest, concomitant with improving education and job skills, and 
helping forgotten and disadvantaged communities—can better address the well-being of racial/ethnic 
minorities. 
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Introduction 
 

Individual explanations of poverty suggest that indivi-
duals with lower levels of education and job experiences 
are employed in low-wage jobs and are therefore likely to 
have lower earnings and be in poverty. Alternatively, 
individuals with higher education and better job experi-
ences should earn higher wages and hence are less likely to 
be poor. These views are used to explain why racial/ethnic 
minorities, who tend to have lower levels of education, are 
in low-wage jobs. Human capital theorists emphasize these 
same relationships (Becker, 1964; Lichter, Beaulieu, 
Findeis, & Teixeira, 1993). 

The ongoing restructuring of Midwestern economies 
has not only created new structures of work but has also 
constrained choices available to workers in different labor 
markets and at home. Structural explanations of poverty 
stress the lack of access to opportunities in local labor 
market areas (LMAs) as the main cause of high levels of 
poverty among racial/ethnic groups, immigrants, and 
women (Iceland, 2006). Deindustrialization, racial segre-
gation, and discrimination have hindered the economic 
well-being and mobility of minorities, especially those 
with lower levels of education and job skills (Alderson & 
Nielsen, 2002). According to Tickamyer et al. (1993), 
economic restructuring has been linked to the degradation 
of economic well-being of many families, race and gender 
inequality, increased poverty, a more polarized class 
structure, and a decline in employment opportunities. 

Community social organization explanations of poverty 
stress the deterioration and/or lack of social capital that 
keeps other communities vibrant. In agreement with 
Coleman (1988), Putnam (1993 & 1995) defines social 
capital as features of social organization—such as net-
works, norms, and trust—that facilitate coordination and 
cooperation for mutual benefit (p. 36; p. 67). Social 
capital, Putnam believes, is a “precondition of economic 
development” (1993:37). Communities with higher levels 
of social capital are expected to foster better economic 
development and, therefore, lower poverty levels. 

Spatial explanations of poverty highlight the uneven 
development of places, arguing that access to employment 
opportunities and associated economic well-being are 
unevenly distributed across geopolitical spaces (Lyson & 
Falk, 1993; Tickamyer et al., 1993). The impact of econo-
mic restructuring, for example, has been uneven across 
spaces, affecting individuals, families, and communities in 
different locations, especially those in nonmetropolitan 
areas and those in central cities of metropolitan areas 
(Tickamyer & Bokemeier, 1993; Tickamyer & Latimer, 
1993; Wilson, 1987 & 1996). 

Social stratification explanations of poverty underline 
the hierarchical and uneven access to opportunities across 
race/ethnicity, social class, gender, and immigrant status. 
Racial/ethnic minorities are on average more likely than 
Non-Hispanic Whites to have lower levels of education, 
lower levels of employment, lower wages, and chronic 
health conditions—all characteristics associated with 
higher poverty rates (Iceland, 2006; O’Hare, 1996). 
Women, compared to men, continue to occupy lower 
economic positions. Women—especially minority, female-
headed households—are also more likely to be in poverty. 
Immigrant families are in general at a greater risk of 
poverty than non-immigrant families, and poverty rates are 
highest among recent immigrants (Starrels, Bould, & 
Nicholas, 1994). 

An analysis that bridges the gaps between these con-
ceptual explanations can improve our understanding of 
poverty and why poverty persists, especially among racial/ 
ethnic and other socially disadvantaged groups. This study 
addresses four main research questions about household 
poverty in the Midwest: (1) How does race/ethnicity influ-
ence household poverty? (2) Does the association between 
race/ethnicity and household poverty persist after control-
ling for household structure, educational attainment, indus-
try of employment, and other individual and household 
confounders? (3) Does the association between nonmetro-
politan/metropolitan LMA and household poverty persist 
after controlling for individual and household predictors in 
a multilevel model? (4) How do local LMA opportunity 
structures, as measured by both industry structure and qua-
lity of jobs, influence household poverty after controlling 
for individual, household, nonmetropolitan/metropolitan 
location, and LMA compositional and structural charac-
teristics, such as economic disadvantage, immigrant 
concentration, and residential stability? 

 
Theoretical Background 

 
The causes of household poverty include both micro- 

and macro-level theories. These theories can generally be 
grouped into five main categories: 

(1) Individual explanations that emphasize the 
characteristics, attitudes, or behavior of the poor (e.g., 
human capital theory);  
(2) Economic restructuring and global processes that 
highlight the forces that affect the distribution and 
changes in opportunity structures; 
(3) Community social organization explanations that 
highlight the importance of social networks and social 
capital for economic development; 



 

 

(4) Social stratification across social groups, including 
race/ethnicity, immigrant status, and gender; and 
(5) Spatial theories that focus on the uneven distribution 
of opportunity structures across space. 

 
Human Capital Theory Explanations 

Neoclassical economic theory emphasizes the role of 
individual characteristics, such as family background and 
educational level, and how these factors affect people’s 
economic well-being. The human capital theory (Becker, 
1964; Lichter et al., 1993) posits that workers with weak 
skill levels due to lack of education or relevant experience 
are less productive at work and therefore poorly remu-
nerated in the labor market and experience more job 
instability. Alternatively, more skillful or experienced 
workers are arguably more productive employees and 
therefore earn higher wages and experience more job 
stability (Castle, 1993; Snipp, Horton, Jensen, Nagel, & 
Rochin, 1993; Tickamyer et al., 1993). From this perspec-
tive, investments by individuals in education and skills are 
rewarded in the labor market. 

Critics of the human capital theory indicate that it has 
not explained why poverty is more prevalent and persistent 
among minorities, women, female-headed households with 
children, immigrants, or among rural and central-city 
residents. While this view is informative and dominates 
research and policy on poverty, emphasis on individual 
attributes and actions often overlook the enormous impact 
of social, economic, and political systems on poverty 
(Iceland, 2006; O’Conner, 2001). These critics emphasize 
instead structural causes, arguing that people are poor 
because there are not enough good jobs rather than that 
they don’t have enough skills or lack motivation (Falk & 
Lyson, 1988; Tomaskovic-Devey, 1987). The enormous 
importance of human capital, especially in today’s infor-
mation economy, cannot be overemphasized. Structural 
realities that are external to individuals’ attributes and 
abilities, referred to as “opportunity structure,” constrain 
the range of options available to individuals. Thus, while 
individual attributes such as human capital may partially 
explain poverty differentials and income gaps, existing 
opportunity structures may better explain the level of 
poverty and why it persists. 
 
Economic Restructuring Explanations 

In the last four decades, the U.S. economy has 
experienced three major, interrelated changes: 

(1) deindustrialization—the transition in employment 
from extractive and manufacturing industries to service 
and information Industries; 
(2) the increase in new technologies, especially in 
microelectronics and other high-tech industries; and 

(3) globalization—the integration of international 
markets for goods, services, capital, information, and 
labor (Brady, Beckfield, & Zhao, 2007). 
These economic transformations have created not only 

new structures of work, but they have constrained choices 
available to workers in different labor markets and at 
home. They have been linked to the degradation of econo-
mic well-being of households, race and gender inequality, 
increased poverty, a more polarized class structure, and 
reduced employment opportunities (O’Conner, 2001; 
Tickamyer, 1996). 

The transfer of jobs from manufacturing to service 
industries produced lower wages and greater poverty 
(Alderson & Nielsen, 2002; Gustafsson & Johansson, 
1999; Moller, Huber, Stephens, Bradley, & Nielsen, 2003). 
The shift of employment in the economy from manufac-
turing to services resulted in the destruction of a dispropor-
tionate number of higher wage jobs, especially those that 
primarily require manual skill. In their place, the service 
and retail trade sectors of the economy generated millions 
of new jobs, but these tended to be associated with a 
polarized earnings distribution and poverty (Bluestone & 
Harrison, 1990; Iceland, 1997 & 2006). In traditional 
manufacturing LMAs of the Midwest, economic restruc-
turing meant the loss of many good jobs, especially low-
skilled, blue-collar jobs with greater incomes as well as 
health insurance and retirement benefits. The newly 
created jobs in the service sector of the economy were of 
two kinds: (1) those requiring high education and technical 
skills, and (2) those requiring lower job skills. 

With deindustrialization, a growing number of jobs 
were part-time, contingency, subcontracted, or temporary, 
with irregular work schedules and high layoff and turnover 
rates (Seccombe, 2000). Technological changes in the 
economy also played a role in increasing inequality by 
raising the demand for high-skilled workers, such as 
engineers and programmers, while reducing the demand 
for lower-skilled, low-paid workers (Iceland, 2006). Thus, 
a major effect of deindustrialization has been that many 
families, especially those with lower skills and educational 
levels, have been unable to find jobs, especially jobs that 
pay well enough to lift them out of poverty and economic 
uncertainty, and that offer fringe benefits, such as health 
insurance and pensions. 

Three aspects of globalization may have affected the 
incidence of poverty in advanced countries: an increase in 
imports from nonindustrial economies, capital mobility, 
and immigration (Alderson & Nielsen, 2002). First, the 
importation of manufactured goods from less developed 
countries places workers in advanced countries in direct 
competition with those in less developed countries. Work-
ers in less developed countries are paid lower wages and 



 

 

are not unionized, and labor and environmental regu-
lations, if they exist, are less stringent than those in 
advanced countries. The lower labor costs and lack of 
environmental regulation costs make the import of manu-
factured goods economically beneficial to companies but 
costly to workers, because they reduce wages and increase 
unemployment, especially for the least-skilled workers. 

A second aspect of globalization is capital mobility, 
known as “capital flight,” from developed to developing 
economies. The reasons for capital flight include offers of 
tax incentives, low labor costs, and less regulations. As a 
result of capital flight, the deindustrialization process in 
advanced countries is exacerbated (Alderson & Nielsen, 
2002). The global capital flight option empowers firms 
more than it does for government and labor because firms 
are able to demand tax and social policy concessions from 
the government and wage concessions from organized 
labor (Alderson & Nielsen, 2002; Moller et al., 2003). 

Related to globalization and economic restructuring is 
the continuous decline of labor unions. Greater unioniza-
tion is normally associated with reduced income inequality 
and well-being (Alderson & Nielsen, 2002; Gustafsson & 
Johansson, 1999; Kazarda, 1995), while nonunionized 
workers typically are paid lower wages and have less job 
security (Iceland, 2006). Yet, the proportion of the work-
force that is unionized has been declining since the 1950s, 
with that decline accelerating after the mid-1970s 
(Danziger & Gottschalk, 1995). 

The third component of globalization is immigration. 
According to estimates from the American Community 
Survey (ACS), 2005–2007, about 37.2 million people in 
the United States were foreign born, representing 12.5 
percent of the U.S. population. Among the foreign-born 
population, 53.4 percent were born in Latin America, 26.7 
percent in Asia, 13.4 percent in Europe, and the remaining 
6.5 percent in other regions. The foreign-born population 
from Central America, including Mexico, accounted for 
70.6 percent of the foreign-born population from Latin 
America. A higher rate of immigration has been linked 
both to greater poverty and to greater inequality in 
advanced countries (Alderson & Nielsen, 2002; Borjas, 
Freeman, & Katz, 1992). 
 
Spatial Explanations 

Theories of place emphasize the way in which poverty 
is distributed unevenly across space. Economic well-being 
is not only unevenly distributed across race/ethnicity, 
social class, gender, and other social strata, but it is also 
unevenly distributed across geopolitical spaces. The 
impact of economic restructuring has been uneven across 
spaces, affecting individuals, families, and communities in 
different locations (Lobao, 1990; Lyson & Falk, 1993; 

Tickamyer et al., 1993). Theories of place focus on local 
social and economic structures, arguing that the economic 
well-being of localities will increase the economic well-
being of individuals (Tickamyer et al., 1993). From this 
perspective, poverty is a consequence of both local and 
extra-local distribution of resources, including economic 
and political power. In both rural and urban areas, many 
communities lack stable employment, opportunities for 
upward mobility, investment in the community or regions, 
and diversity in the economy and other social institutions 
(Tickamyer & Duncan, 1990). The uneven distribution of 
jobs and wages results in low opportunity and high poverty 
rates for people and places (Tickamyer & Bokemeier, 
1993; Tickamyer & Latimer, 1993; Wilson, 1987 & 1996). 

In urban areas, poverty persists because of the com-
bined and interacting effects of joblessness, deteriorating 
neighborhoods, and the “oppositional” culture that these 
forces generate (Duncan, 1999; Wilson, 1987 & 1996). 
Wilson (1996) indicates that inner-city poverty was 
exacerbated during the 1970s and 1980s when work 
disappeared from those communities and the poor become 
isolated from the mainstream. In many parts of the 
Midwest, urban communities, like Chicago and Detroit, 
lost good blue-collar jobs to the suburbs and overseas 
locations. At the same time, stable working-class families 
were moving out because antidiscrimination laws opened 
suburban housing to African Americans, and affirmative 
action created new employment opportunities for many 
college-educated minorities (Duncan, 1999; Wilson, 1987 
& 1996). 

In rural areas, economic restructuring has intensified 
the already existing disadvantages of rural communities 
(Lyson, Falk, Henry, Hickey, & Warner, 1993; Tickamyer 
& Duncan, 1990). Rural communities not only differ in 
size, physical infrastructure, and economic base, but also 
in their social infrastructure (Flora & Flora, 1993). Non-
metropolitan families are more likely to be in economic 
distress and poverty than their metropolitan counterparts 
(Castle, 1993). Nonmetropolitan areas have relatively 
limited employment and earnings opportunities and less 
diversified labor markets (Tickamyer & Duncan, 1990). 
 
Social Capital Explanations 

Many social scientists have used distinct but comple-
mentary definitions of social capital (e.g., Bourdieu, 1985; 
Coleman, 1988 & 1990; Flora, 1998; Portes, 1998 & 2000; 
Portes & Sensebrenner, 1993; Putnam, 1993 & 1995; 
Woolcock, 1998). What they have in common is that 
social capital secures benefits to actors by virtue of mem-
bership in social networks or other social structures 
(Portes, 1998). For example, Putnam (1993 & 1995) 
defines social capital as features of social organization—



 

 

such as networks, norms, and trust—that facilitate coordi-
nation and cooperation for mutual benefit (p.36; p. 67). 
Social capital, Putnam believes, is a “precondition of 
economic development” (1993:37). He indicates that 
“working together is easier in a community that is blessed 
with a substantial stock of social capital” (Putnam 
1993:35–36). 
 
Social Stratification Explanations 

In U.S. society, minorities are on average more likely 
than Non-Hispanic Whites to have lower levels of educa-
tion, lower levels of employment, lower wages, and 
chronic health problems—all characteristics associated 
with higher poverty rates (Iceland, 2006; O’Hare, 1996). 
The lack of access to opportunities both in schools and 
labor markets results in minorities occupying disadvan-
taged positions in society. African Americans, Asian 
Americans, Latinos, and Native Americans—and even 
many White ethnic groups, such as the Irish—have all 
historically had to cope with limited opportunities though 
their experiences have qualitatively differed (Iceland, 
2006). 

Wilson (1987) indicates that it is not so much that racial 
segregation and discrimination have been eliminated as 
that they have become less rampant, whereas economic 
conditions play an increasingly important role in deter-
mining African American disadvantage. He argues that 
deindustrialization and class segregation in particular have 
hampered the economic mobility of less-skilled African 
Americans in the labor markets (Wilson, 1987). Massey & 
Denton (1993) also argue that segregation, interacting with 
economic forces, reinforces minority poverty by limiting 
access to a potentially broad range of metropolitan-area 
employment opportunities. Another factor that explains 
higher poverty rates among the African American popula-
tion is that they have on average lower levels of education, 
quality of educational opportunities, and subsequent work 
experiences (Iceland, 2006). 

Iceland (2006) indicates that some of the processes that 
have hampered African American economic well-being, 
such as discrimination, segregation, and human capital 
differentials, have also affected other minority groups—
Latinos, Asian Americans, and Native Americans—though 
the experiences of each group differ considerably because 
of its regional concentration, population size, labor market 
niche, and the Non-Hispanic White population’s reaction 
to its presence in, or immigration to, the United States 
(Iceland, 2006:84). According to Iceland (2006), Latinos 
and Asians have historically been discriminated against, 
have recently experienced increases in their population due 
to immigration, and are very heterogeneous in terms of 
their national origins and educational levels. Yet, Latinos 

are significantly more likely than Asians to be poor, and 
both groups have higher poverty rates than Non-Hispanic 
Whites. 

Immigrant families in general are at greater risk of 
poverty and have lower incomes than non-immigrant 
families. Limited language proficiency and unfamiliarity 
with U.S. customs and the labor market considerably 
hinder immigrant economic mobility in the short run. But 
over time and in subsequent generations, labor market 
barriers become less important (Borjas, 1990; Iceland, 
2006). In general, poverty rates are highest among recent 
immigrants, particularly among recent migrants from 
Mexico (Iceland, 2006). 

The results of the influence of immigration on poverty 
and income levels are mixed. Some studies suggest that an 
increasing number and proportion of immigrants have 
been arriving with very low levels of skills, contributing to 
higher overall immigrant poverty rates (Borjas, 1990). 
This influx of low-skilled migrants is often viewed as 
increasing poverty, in part because they displace native 
workers and threaten their wages, although this relation-
ship is contested (Portes & Zhou, 1992; Waldinger, 1996). 
Other studies argue that overall levels of racial and class 
polarization have increased, with immigrants concentrated 
in “casual” jobs and native Whites concentrated in pro-
fesssional jobs (Frey & Liaw, 1998; McCall, 2001; 
Mollenkopf & Castells, 1991; Sassen, 1991). The influ-
ence of recent immigration on poverty and income levels 
is likely to depend on both the characteristics of immi-
grants and those of places in which they reside (Alba, 
Logan, & Stults, 2000). 

In general, women tend to have higher poverty rates 
and lower incomes than men because they have fewer 
resources and because they are more likely to be the heads 
of single-headed families (Devine, Plunkett, & Wright, 
1992; Iceland, 2006; Starrels et al., 1994; Stevens, 1999). 
The term “feminization of poverty” is often used to refer to 
females’ greater likelihood of being poor and the growing 
number of poor people living in female-headed families. 

Despite the narrowing gap in employment and earnings 
opportunities between men and women, women continue 
to occupy lower economic positions and to assume pri-
mary responsibility for childcare, household labor, and 
related family arrangements. Some scholars argue that 
women’s lower economic status reflects the unequal distri-
bution of power in society (England, 1994; Hartmann, 
1994). Tickamyer et al. (1993) indicate that women’s eco-
nomic opportunities are conditioned and shaped by their 
disadvantage in the wage labor market; by their high parti-
cipation in informal and unpaid labor, both productive and 
unproductive; and by state policies toward women, work, 
and welfare. 



 

 

Minority women tend to be overrepresented among the 
poor because of their minority status and higher rates of 
single parenthood (Starrels et al., 1994). Poverty is most 
feminized among African American and Puerto Rican 
families, mainly because these women are more likely than 
other women to become single-parent householders, be out 
of the labor force, live in low-income neighborhoods, have 
low levels of education, and face labor-market discrimi-
nation (Lichter & Landale, 1995; Starrels, et al., 1994). 
 
Summary 

This study integrates human capital, economic restruc-
turing, social capital, social stratification, and spatial 
theories to explain household poverty. I argue that indivi-
dual human capital, such as educational attainment and 
skills, partially explain household poverty. The transform-
ation of the economy in the last four decades has affected 
household poverty as evidenced by the type of industrial 
employment and quality of jobs. From an economic 
restructuring perspective, household poverty has become 
increasingly dependent upon service industries, particu-
larly lower-wage service industries, as compared to other 
industrial groups. Employment in agriculture and manu-
facturing industries, which has for a long time sustained 
the well-being of a large number of households, underwent 
sharp contractions while the service sector has increased. 
The restructuring of the economy has been associated with 
a shift not only in the quantity, but also in the quality of 
jobs. This shift in employment structure resulted, on the 
one hand, in a number of high-quality jobs offering high 
wages and benefits, security, and occupational mobility, 
and on the other hand a number of low-quality jobs. 

The restructuring of the economy has placed much 
greater burdens on nonmetropolitan households. However, 
the rise in service-sector employment in rural areas was 
limited to low-wage jobs, while urban areas experienced a 
rise in jobs at both ends of the wage spectrum. This uneven 
spatial access to economic opportunities suggests that 
households in nonmetropolitan LMAs and those in eco-
nomically disadvantaged and socially isolated metropoli-
tan LMAs have higher poverty rates. In contrast, house-
holds in affluent, residentially stable, and immigrant-
concentrated LMAs are expected to be associated with 
lower poverty rates. It is also expected that the LMA 
opportunity structure as measured by the quantity and 
quality of jobs explains much of household poverty. 

The economic restructuring also impacted the social 
fabric of many communities as economic resources deteri-
orate and the middle-class members migrate out, creating 
conditions such as those illustrated in Wilson’s inner-city 
neighborhoods in the Midwest (1987 & 1996). Communi- 

ties with high levels of residential stability tend to have 
higher levels of social capital and greater employment 
opportunities. Communities with higher levels of social 
capital are expected to have lower poverty. 

From a social stratification perspective, racial/ethnic 
minorities, immigrants, and female-headed households are 
further disadvantaged in terms of household poverty. The 
lack of access to opportunities in both schools and LMAs 
results in minorities having lower levels of income and 
higher levels of poverty. Deindustrialization, racial segre-
gation, and discrimination have hindered the economic 
well-being and mobility of minorities, especially those 
with lower levels of education. Immigrant families, espe-
cially those with lower levels of education and financial 
capital, are also at greater risk of poverty than non-immi-
grant families. From a social stratification perspective, it is 
also expected that single female-headed households, 
particularly minority single-female–headed households, 
will be most likely to be in poverty. 
 

Research Methods 
 
Data 

The data for this chapter are drawn from the ACS 
Public Use Microdata Sample (PUMS) 2005–2007 for 
individual and household characteristics and from the ACS 
Summary Files 2005–2007 for Public Use Microdata Area 
(PUMA)-level characteristics. The ACS PUMS is a sample 
of population and housing unit records from the ACS and 
the Puerto Rican Community Survey. The three-year ACS 
PUMS file combines responses from the 2005, 2006, and 
2007 PUMS files and contains data for housing units and 
persons from households. The analysis in this chapter uses 
2005–2007 PUMS data from Midwest states. 

The level-1 unit of analysis is the household. Only 
households with the head, spouse, or partner (if present) of 
working age, i.e., between sixteen and sixty-four years, are 
used. Excluded from the analysis are non-family house-
holds living alone, sub-families within households, mili-
tary households, households with zero income, and group-
quarter units. 

The ACS Summary File contains sample data about the 
characteristics of different geographic units. Summary 
tables for characteristics of interest at the PUMA level 
were tabulated and aggregated at the place of work 
(POWPUMA) using the relationship between PUMAs and 
POWPUMAs. Thus, the level-2 unit of analysis is the 
LMA, encompassing both the PUMA place of residence 
and PUMA place of work. For U.S. Census Bureau confi-
dentiality requirements, PUMA places contain at least 
100,000 people. 
 



 

 

Measures 
The outcome demographic and household charac-

teristics were used as controls at level 1 (see Table 1): 
measure is household poverty. Three measures of house-
hold poverty are included in the analysis: household 
income below 100 percent of the federal poverty line; 
household income below 125 percent of the federal 
poverty line; and household income between 100 and 150 
percent of the federal poverty line. 

The following socio-demographic and household char-
acteristics were used as controls at level 1 (see Table 1): 
householder’s age (years); immigrant status (i.e., if foreign 
born); disability status (if at least the householder, spouse, 
or partner [if present] has a disability limitation); gender 
(female vs. male); household structure (formerly-married 
household [divorced, separated, or widowed], never-
married household, dual-headed married couples, and 
dual-headed cohabiting with an unmarried partner); educa-
tional attainment (highest education of householder and 
spouse/partner, if present); industry of employment (agri-
culture, forestry, and fishing; construction/low-wage 
manufacturing; traditional high-wage industries [high-
wage manufacturing, mining, and government]; distri-
butional services; high-wage services; and consumer 
services); job quality (either the householder and/or 
spouse/partner, if present, was employed part-time; not 
working/unemployed; employed in service occupations); 
and length of residence (years). 

At the LMA level, geographical location is measured 
by an indicator of nonmetropolitan status, which indicates 
whether a household was located in a nonmetropolitan 
LMA or not. The opportunity structure is measured by the 
LMA industrial structure and the percentage of good jobs. 
Industrial structure is measured by the percentage of resi-
dents sixteen years or older employed in the following 
industries: extractive industries, such as agriculture, fores-
try, fishing, and mining, and government industries (a 
standardized factor score); low-wage manufacturing (z-
score); high-wage manufacturing (z-score); and consumer 
services (a standardized factor score combining retail 
trade, art, entertainment and recreational services, and 
other services, such as automotive, repair, and personal 
services). The quality of jobs available in an LMA is 
assessed by the ratio of core industries (traditional high-
wage industries and high-wage services) to peripheral 
industries (agriculture, forestry, and fisheries; construction 
and low-wage manufacturing; and consumer services) and 
by the presence of good jobs—a standardized factor score 
of the following variables: the percentage of residents six-
teen years or older employed in managerial, professional, 
and technical occupations; and the percentage holding jobs 

in the information, finance and insurance, real estate, and 
rental and leasing fields. 

At the LMA level, the following structural charac-
teristics are controlled: concentrated disadvantaged, a 
standardized factor score of the following variables: per-
centage of Non-Hispanic African Americans, percentage 
of female-headed families with children under eighteen 
years, percentage of residents in poverty, percentage of 
households on public assistance or receiving cash assis-
tance, percentage of residents unemployed, and percentage 
of residents twenty-five years or older with less than high 
school education; immigrant concentration, a standardized 
factor score of the percentage of Latinos, the percentage of 
Asians, and the percentage of foreign-born populations; 
residential stability, a standardized factor score of the 
percentage of owner-occupied housing units and the per-
centage of residents who have been in the LMS for one 
year or longer and have stayed in the same house for the 
past year (non-movers). Another control included in the 
analysis is the population size of each LMA, transformed 
in logarithm to reduce skewness. All variables are sum-
marized in Table 1 (page 7–8). 
 
Analytical Strategy 

A multilevel logistic regression model (Raudenbush & 
Bryk, 2002) is used to model the odds that a household in 
a given LMA is in poverty. The primary outcome of inter-
est is whether the household is in poverty (125 percent 
poverty threshold), coded 1, or otherwise, coded 0. The 
odds that a household is in poverty are modeled as a func-
tion of individual, household, and LMA characteristics. 
Specifically, let Yij = 1 if household i in LMA j is in 
poverty and Yij = 0 if otherwise. Rather than modeling the 
probability that household i in LMA j is in poverty, Prob 
(Yij=1) = φij, we model the natural logarithm of the odds 
ratio, ηij = log [φij/(1- φij)]. The level-1 structural model is 
expressed as follows: 

௜௝ߟ ൌ ଴௝ߚ ൅ ∑ ௤௤ߚ ܺ௤௜௝ (1) 
where ܺ௤௜௝ is the value of covariate q for household i in 
LMA j, βq is the partial effect of covariate q, and β0j the 
intercept of the level-1 model. At level 2, the level-1 
intercept is expected to depend upon the nonmetropoli-
tan/metropolitan location and other LMA characteristics, 
such as concentrated disadvantaged, immigrant concentra-
tion, residential stability, and LMA opportunity structure 
plus a random effect. The level-2 structural model is as 
follows: 

଴௝ߚ ൌ ଴଴ߛ  ൅ ∑ ଴௦௦ߛ ௦ܹ௝ ൅ ߤ଴௝, (2) 
where ߛ଴଴ is the average log-odds of household poverty 
across all LMAs, ௦ܹ௝ are the LMA-level predictors, ߛ଴௦ 
are LMA-level regression coefficients, and ߤ଴௝ the random  



 

 



 

 

effects, assumed to be normally distributed with mean 0 
and variance τ. 

In the final model, the coefficients for Latinos, ߚଵ௝, 
African Americans, ߚଶ௝, Asians, ߚଷ௝, and other racial 
groups, ߚସ௝, are allowed to be a function of level-2 
predictors plus a random effect, while coefficients for 
other predictors are considered fixed. The equations for 
these coefficients would be as follows: 

ଵ௝ߚ ൌ   ଵ଴ߛ ൅ ∑ ଵ௦௦ߛ ௦ܹ௝ ൅ ߤଵ௝, (3) 
ଶ௝ߚ ൌ ଶ଴ߛ  ൅ ∑ ଶ௦௦ߛ ௦ܹ௝ ൅ ߤଶ௝, (4) 
ଷ௝ߚ ൌ ଷ଴ߛ  ൅ ∑ ଷ௦௦ߛ ݆ݏܹ ൅  ଷ௝, (5)ߤ 

ସ௝ߚ ൌ   ସ଴ߛ ൅ ߤସ௝, (6) 
௣௝ߚ ൌ ,௣଴ߛ  ݌ ൐ 4 (7) 

The analysis proceeds from examining the household 
effects to looking at the LMA’s effects on the household’s 
odds of being poor. The first set of models examines the 
effects of race/ethnicity (Model 1). The second stage adds 
household background (household structure and educa-
tional levels) and industry of employment (Models 2, 3, & 
4). The last set of models examines the effects of LMA 
characteristics, including nonmetropolitan/metropolitan 
location (Model 5), LMA structural characteristics, such as 
economic disadvantage, immigrant concentration, and 
residential stability (Model 6), opportunity structure 
(Models 7 & 8), and combining LMA opportunity struc-
ture and the structural characteristics of LMAs (Models 9 
&10) on households’ odds of being poor, net of individual 
and household predictors. 

Results 
 
Descriptive Statistics 

Table 2 (page 9) displays household poverty rates using 
the official poverty threshold (i.e., household income less 
than 100 percent poverty threshold) by race/ethnicity and 
nonmetropolitan/metropolitan residence. The statistics in 
Table 2 reveal that African Americans, followed by Native 
Americans and Latinos, especially Mexican Americans, 
rank among the poorest in the Midwest. African 
Americans in the Midwest are almost 4 times as likely as 
Non-Hispanic Whites to have poverty-level household 
incomes and Native Americans are more than 3 times as 
likely; compared with Latinos at 2.5 times as likely and 
Asians at 1.5 times as likely as Non-Hispanic Whites to 
have poverty-level household incomes. Household poverty 
rates are consistently higher in nonmetropolitan areas than 
in metropolitan areas, regardless of race/ethnicity. 
Racial/ethnic minority residents of nonmetropolitan areas 
experience the burden of economic hardship more than 
those in metropolitan areas. 

Table 2 also displays household poverty rates 
calculated using the 125 percent poverty threshold by 
race/ethnicity and nonmetropolitan/metropolitan residence. 
The statistics in Table 2 reveal that African Americans are 
more than 3 times as likely as Non-Hispanic Whites to 
have poverty-level household incomes and Native Amer-
icans 3 times as likely. Latinos are almost 2.4 times as 
likely as Non-Hispanic Whites to have poverty-level 



 

 

household incomes, while Asians are 1.4 times as likely. 
Native Americans and Non-Hispanic Whites living in 
nonmetropolitan areas are 1.6 times as likely as their 
metropolitan counterparts to have poverty-level household 
incomes. African Americans, Latinos, and Asians living in 
nonmetropolitan areas are also more likely to have 
poverty-level household incomes, but the gap between 
them and their metropolitan counterparts is not as great. 
About 40 percent of African Americans, 38 percent of 
Native Americans, 30 percent of Latinos, 18 percent of 
Asians, and 14 percent of Non-Hispanic Whites living in 
nonmetropolitan areas did not earn enough to raise them-
selves above the margins of poverty. Among Latinos, 30 
percent of Mexican Americans and 27 percent of other 
Latinos living in nonmetropolitan areas have poverty-level 
household incomes. 

Table 2 also displays near-household poverty rates, 
defined as poverty between 100 and 150 percent of the 
poverty threshold, by race/ethnicity and nonmetropolitan/ 
metropolitan area of residence. The statistics in Table 2 
show that Latinos, especially Mexican Americans, are 
more likely than other racial/ethnic groups to have near 
poverty-level household incomes—2.2 times as likely as 
Non-Hispanic Whites. African Americans and Native 
Americans are almost twice as likely as Non-Hispanic 
Whites to have near poverty-level household incomes. The 
statistics in Table 2 show that Asians are not significantly 
different from Non-Hispanic Whites in terms of having 
near poverty-level household incomes. Near-poverty 

household income rates are slightly higher in nonmetro-
politan areas than in metropolitan areas, regardless of 
race/ethnicity. 

Table 2 also displays median household income by 
race/ethnicity and nonmetropolitan/metropolitan residence. 
The statistics in Table 2 reveal that African Americans and 
Native Americans, followed by Latinos, have lower me-
dian household incomes than Non-Hispanic Whites and 
Asians. Among Latinos, Mexican Americans have lower 
median household incomes than other Latinos. The median 
household income for Latinos is 60 percent lower than the 
median household income for Non-Hispanic Whites. 
Asians have the highest median household income, while 
African Americans have the lowest median household 
income. The statistics in Table 2 also show that the median 
household income in nonmetropolitan areas for Latinos is 
about 17 percent lower than the median household income 
in metropolitan areas; 20 percent lower for African 
Americans; 24 percent lower for Non-Hispanic Whites; 
and 26 percent lower for Asians. 

 
Multivariate Analysis 

Table 3 displays the results of separate unconditional 
models of household poverty for men and women. The 
average log-odds of household poverty are estimated at  
-2.099 (se = 0.028). This corresponds to estimated average 
odds of household poverty of 0.123 (95% Confidence 
Interval [CI]: 0.116, 0.130). Converted into probabilities, 
this corresponds to an average probability of household 



 

 

poverty of 0.109. The random part of the model also pro-
vides valuable information about the between-LMA varia-
bility in terms of household poverty rates. Given the vari-
ance estimate of 0.249, 95 percent plausible values of 
LMA average log-odds of household poverty fall between 
-3.077 and -1.121. This corresponds to a 95 percent CI of 
the LMA-average odds of household poverty that ranges 
from 0.046 to 0.326, suggesting greater variability in 
household poverty rates between LMAs. 

The results in Table 3 also show that women are more 
likely than men to be poor. The average log-odds of house-
hold poverty are estimated at -2.518 (se = 0.030) for men 
and -1.646 (se = 0.027) for women. This corresponds to 
average odds of being poor of 0.081 (95% CI: 0.076, 
0.086) for men and 0.193 (95% CI: 0.183, 0.203) for 
women. In terms of probabilities, the average probability 
of being poor is estimated at 0.075 for men and 0.162 for 
women. The between-LMA variability in odds of house-
hold poverty ranges from 0.030 to 0.219 for men and from 
0.076 to 0.488 for women. 

Table 4 displays the 
results of a multilevel 
logistic regression model 
of household poverty on 
race/ethnicity for both 
men and women. The 
results indicate that the 
log-odds of household 
poverty are significantly 
higher for Latinos, 
African Americans, 
Asians, and other racial 
groups than those of 
Non-Hispanic Whites. 
Taking antilog of coef-
ficients in Table 4 for 
both men and women,  
 
 

these results indicate that the odds of household poverty 
are 2.823 (95% CI: 2.668, 2.986) times higher for Latinos; 
3.665 (95% CI: 3.415, 3.934) times higher for African 
Americans; 1.489 (95% CI: 1.348, 1.644) times higher for 
Asians; and 2.743 (95% CI: 2.522, 2.982) times higher for 
other racial groups than those of Non-Hispanic Whites. 
Also notice that the intercept variance, ߬̂00, was reduced 
from 0.249 (unconditional model) to 0.216, corresponding 
to about a 13 percent variance reduction. 

The results in Table 4 also show that the odds of house-
hold poverty not only differ by race/ethnicity, but also by 
gender. The odds of household poverty are 3.126 times 
(95% CI: 2.910, 3.358) higher for Latino men; 3.013 times 
(95% CI: 2.764, 3.284) higher for African American men; 
1.727 times (95% CI: 1.538, 1.938) higher for Asian men; 
and 2.683 times (95% CI: 2.424, 2.970) times higher for 
men in other racial groups than they are for Non-Hispanic 
White men. In comparison, the odds of household poverty 
are 2.685 times (95% CI: 2.504, 2.879) higher for Latinas; 
3.433 times (95% CI: 3.181, 3.706) higher for African 

American women; 1.434 
times (95% CI: 1.270, 
1.620) higher for Asian 
women; and 2.528 times 
(95% CI: 2.303, 2.775) 
higher for women in 
other racial groups than 
for Non-Hispanic White 
women. In the model for 
men, the intercept vari-
ance, ߬̂00, was reduced 
by 10 percent, from 



 

 

0.261 (unconditional model) to 0.235 (see Table 3), while 
in the model for women, it was reduced by 9 percent, from 
0.225 to 0.205. 

Table 5 displays the results of a multilevel logistic 
regression model of household poverty rate on individual 
and household predictors (full model—both men and 
women). Model 1 presents coefficient estimates from a 
model of household poverty on race/ethnicity, controlling 
for householder’s gender, age, disability status, and immi-
grant status. Exponentiating the log-odds coefficients, 
these results indicate that Latinos’ odds of poverty are exp 

(0.710) = 2.035 times those of Non-Hispanic Whites, on 
average (95% CI: 1.867, 2.217). The odds of poverty for 
African Americans are 3.041 times those of Non-Hispanic 
Whites (95% CI: 2.816, 3.284), and the odds of poverty for 
other racial groups are 1.922 times those of Non-Hispanic 
Whites (95% CI: 1.762, 2.097). The odds of poverty for 
Asians are not statistically different from those of Non-
Hispanic Whites. The results in Model 1 also indicate that 
household poverty is 2.073 times higher among female-
headed households than male-headed households (95% CI: 
2.015, 2,133); 1.635 times higher among immigrant house-



 

 

holds (95% CI: 1.542, 1.734); and 5.587 times higher 
among households in which the householder or spouse/ 
partner (if present) has a disability limitation (95% CI: 
5.432, 5.747); and that poverty is negatively related to age. 
Also notice that the intercept variance, ߬̂00, was reduced 
from 0.249 (unconditional model) to 0.178 (Model 1), 
corresponding to about 29 percent variance reduction. 

Model 2 in Table 5 introduces controls for household 
structure and composition. The results in this model show 
that the odds of poverty for cohabiting households (i.e., 
single householders living with unmarried partners) are 
2.248 [exp (0.810)] times those of married-couple house-
holds (95% CI: 2.150, 2.351). As expected, the odds of 
poverty for single- and formerly-married (divorced, 
separated, and widowed)–headed households are 4.931 
times those of married-couple households (95% CI: 4.723, 
5.147). The odds of poverty are even higher for formerly-
married-female–headed households—about 7.576 times 
those of married-couple households. The results in Model 
2 also show that the odds of poverty for single- and never-
married–headed households are 6.030 times those of 
married-couple households (95% CI: 5.699, 6.380). For 
never-married-female–headed households, the odds of 
poverty are 9.272 times those of married-couple house-
holds. Having children under eighteen years of age 
increases the odds of poverty by a factor of 1.541 [exp 
(0.432)] (95% CI: 1.519, 1.563). Notice that adding house-
hold structure indicators in the model reduces the logistic 
regression coefficient that describes the gap between 
Latinos and Non-Hispanic Whites by 12 percent. The odds 
ratio describing that gap drops from 2.035 to 1.866 (95% 
CI: 1.708, 2.039). Adjusting for household structure also 
reduces the gap between African Americans and Non-
Hispanic Whites by 30 percent. The odds ratio describing 
that gap drops from 3.041 to 2.181 (95% CI: 2.013, 2.363). 
Introducing household structure in the model also drops 
the gap between other racial groups and Non-Hispanic 
Whites by 18 percent. The odds ratio describing that gap 
drops from 1.922 to 1.703 (95% CI: 1.575, 1.842). 

Model 3 in Table 5 adds controls for educational attain-
ment and length of residence. As expected, the results in 
Model 3 show that the higher the educational attainment of 
householder or spouse/partner (if present), the lower the 
odds of poverty. The odds of poverty for householders 
with a college education are 0.861 = [1 - exp (-1.975)] 
times lower than those of householders with less than a 
high school education. Similarly the odds of poverty for 
householders with some college education are 0.678 [1-
exp (-1.132)] times lower than those of householders with 
less than a high school education. In a similar vein, the 
odds of poverty for householders with a high school edu-
cation are 0.538 [1-exp (-0.773)] times lower than those of 

householders with less than a high school education. The 
results in Model 3 also show that a one-year additional 
length of residence reduces the odds by 0.853 [exp (-
0.159)] times. 

Notice that adding educational attainment and length of 
residence in Model 3 significantly reduces the odds ratio 
describing the gaps between different minority groups and 
Non-Hispanic Whites, implying that one reason Non-
Hispanic Whites have lower levels of poverty than minor-
ity groups is that they are more likely to have higher levels 
of education. The log-odds coefficient that describes the 
gap between Latinos and Non-Hispanic Whites is reduced 
by an additional 68 percent. The odds ratio describing that 
gap drops from 1.866 to 1.223 (95% CI: 1.152, 1.299). 
Adjusting for these controls also reduces the gap between 
African Americans and Non-Hispanic Whites by an addi-
tional 28 percent. The odds ratio describing that gap drops 
from 2.181 to 1.748 (95% CI: 1.655, 1.846). Introducing 
these controls also drops the gap between other racial 
groups and Non-Hispanic Whites by an additional 16 per-
cent. The odds ratio describing that gap drops from 1.703 
to 1.568 (95% CI: 1.452, 1.694). However, adding these 
controls made the coefficient for Asians significant. When 
education and length of residence are controlled, the odds 
of poverty for Asians are 1.398 (95% CI: 1.1261, 1.550) 
times those of Non-Hispanic Whites. 

Model 4 in Table 5 assesses the influence of industry of 
employment while controlling for measures of job quality. 
The results reveal that the odds of poverty for house-
holders who were employed in agriculture, fishing, and 
forestry industries are 1.561 times those of householders in 
consumer-service industries (95% CI = 1.436, 1.697). In 
contrast, the odds of poverty for householders who were 
employed in low-wage manufacturing are 0.314 times 
lower than those of householders employed in consumer-
service industries. Also, the odds of poverty for house-
holders who were employed in high-wage manufacturing 
are 0.582 times lower than those of householders em-
ployed in consumer-service industries. In a similar vein, 
the odds of poverty for householders who were employed 
in distributional service industries are 0.138 times lower 
than those of householders employed in consumer-service 
industries. The results in Model 4 show that the odds of 
poverty for householders employed in high-wage services 
are 0.362 times lower than those of householders em-
ployed in consumer-service industries. Comparing these 
results suggest that householders employed in high-wage 
manufacturing industries are the least likely to be poor. 

Model 5 also adds controls for job quality. The odds of 
poverty for householders working part-time are 5.246 
times those of full-time householders (95% CI = 5.052, 
5.447). The odds of poverty are, as expected, even higher 



 

 

for households in which neither the householder nor 
spouse/partner (if present) was working. For such house-
holds, the odds of poverty are 7.207 times those of house-
holders working full-time (95% CI = 6.944, 7.480). The 
results in Model 5 also show that the odds of poverty for 
householders employed in service occupations are 1.577 
times those of householders employed in other occupa-
tions. 

Adding controls for industry of employment and job 
quality in the model increases the logistic regression coef-
ficient that describes the gap between Latinos and Non-
Hispanic Whites by 47 percent. The odds ratio describing 
that gap increases from 1.223 to 1.344 (95% CI: 1.257, 
1.437). Adjusting for industry of employment and job 
quality also increases the gap between African Americans 
and Non-Hispanic Whites by 4 percent. The odds ratio 
describing that gap increases from 1.748 to 1.788 (95% CI: 
1.705, 1.876). In contrast, introducing industry of employ-
ment and job quality in the model reduces the gap between 
Asians and Non-Hispanic Whites by 27 percent. The odds 
ratio describing that gap drops from 1.398 to 1.277 (95% 
CI: 1.152, 1.416). Introducing these controls also drops the 
gap between other racial groups and Non-Hispanic Whites 
by 8 percent. The odds ratio describing that gap drops 
from 1.568 to 1.509 (95% CI: 1.386, 1.643). Also notice 
that the intercept variance, ߬̂00, was significantly reduced, 
from 0.249 in the unconditional model to 0.119 after all 
individual and household predictors were included in the 
model, corresponding to about a 52 percent variance 
reduction. 

Model 5 adds an indicator of nonmetropolitan status, 
controlling for population size. The results in Model 5 
show that for households in nonmetropolitan areas, the 
odds of poverty are 1.394 times those of households in 
metropolitan areas (95% CI = 1.300, 1.495). Notice that 
when introducing residential location and population size 
in the model, the intercept variance, ߬̂00, was reduced from 
0.119 to 0.089, corresponding to about a 25 percent vari-
ance reduction. 

Table 6 (page 14) displays the results of models that 
include LMA factors. In Table 6, individual and household 
coefficients are omitted; they are essentially identical to 
those shown in Model 5 (Table 5) in terms of direction and 
relative influence on poverty. Instead, only race/ethnicity 
and LMA-level coefficients are displayed. 

Model 6 in Table 6 controls for measures of an LMA’s 
economic disadvantage, immigrant status, and residential 
stability. The results in Model 6 show that a one standard 
deviation increase in economic disadvantage increases the 
odds of poverty by exp (0.039 * 3.62) = 1.152 times. The 
results in Model 6 also show that a one standard deviation 
increase in immigrant concentration reduces the odds of 

poverty by exp (-0.049 * 2.05) = 0.904 times. In a similar 
vein, a one standard deviation increase in residential stabil-
ity reduces the odds of poverty by exp (-0.076 * 1.48) = 
0.894 times. Notice that the intercept variance, ߬̂00, was 
reduced from 0.089 in Model 5 to 0.041 in Model 6, once 
LMA economic disadvantage, immigrant status, and resi-
dential stability indicators were introduced, corresponding 
to 54 percent variance reduction. 

Model 7 in Table 6 drops controls for an LMA’s eco-
nomic disadvantage, immigrant status, and residential 
stability and adds the LMA ratio of core industries to 
peripheral industries. The results in Model 7 show that a 
higher ratio of core to periphery industries in an LMA 
reduces the odds of poverty by exp (-0.218) = 0.804 times 
(95% CI = (0.675, 0.959). This suggests that the greater 
the proportion of good jobs (core industries) in a place, the 
lower the odds of poverty. 

To assess specific influences of LMA industrial struc-
ture on the odds of poverty, Model 8 in Table 6 removes 
the ratio of core to periphery industries and adds standard-
ized measures of the percentage of residents sixteen years 
or older in an LMA employed in the following industries: 
extractive (agriculture, forestry, fishing, and mining) and 
government industries; low-wage manufacturing; high-
wage manufacturing; and consumer services. The results in 
Model 8 show that a one standard deviation increase in the 
percentage of LMA residents sixteen years or older em-
ployed in extractive and government industries increases 
the odds of poverty by exp (0.031 * 1.54) = 1.049 times. 
Similarly, a one standard deviation increase in the percent-
age of LMA residents sixteen years or older employed in 
consumer service industries increases the odds of poverty 
by exp (0.029 * 1.31) = 1.039 times. In contrast, a one  
standard deviation increase in the percentage of LMA 
residents sixteen years or older employed in low-wage 
manufacturing industries reduces the odds of poverty by 
exp (-0.068) = 0.935 times, while a one standard deviation 
increase in the percentage of LMA residents sixteen years 
or older employed in high-wage manufacturing industries 
reduces the odds of poverty by exp (-0.079) = 0.924 times. 

Model 8 also adds the percentage of good jobs—the 
percentage of LMA residents sixteen years or older em-
ployed in managerial, professional, and technical occupa-
tions. The percentage of good jobs in an LMA is linked to 
lower odds of poverty. A one standard deviation increase 
in the percentage of LMA residents sixteen years or older 
employed in managerial, professional, and technical occu-
pations reduces the odds of poverty by exp (-0.094 * 1.54) 
= 0.865 times. Notice that nonmetropolitan residence re-
mains significantly linked to higher odds of poverty. The 
odds of poverty for those in nonmetropolitan LMAs are 
1.127 times those in metropolitan areas, even after control-



 

 

ling for LMA industrial structure indicators. Notice also 
that the intercept variance, ߬̂00, was reduced from 0.089 in 
Model 5 to 0.058 in Model 8, once industry structure 
indicators were introduced in the model, corresponding to 
an additional reduction in variance of 35 percent. 

Model 9 includes nonmetropolitan residence, LMA 
opportunity structure as measured by industrial structure 
and the percentage of good jobs, and LMA socio-structural 
characteristics, including economic disadvantage, immi-
grant status, and residential stability, controlling for popu-
lation size and individual and household characteristics. 
The results in Model 9 show that the odds of poverty are 
higher in nonmetropolitan LMAs than in metropolitan 
ones; higher in economically disadvantaged LMAs and in 
LMAs with a greater proportion of extractive and govern-
ment industries; but lower in LMAs with greater concen-
tration of immigrants and in LMAs with more residential 
stability; and lower in LMAs with greater proportions of 

both low-wage and high-wage manufacturing industries, as 
well as in LMAs with good jobs, i.e., with a greater pro-
portion of residents sixteen years or older employed in 
managerial, professional, and technical occupations. 

The results in Model 9 also show that, even after con-
trolling for individual, household, and LMA characteris-
tics, poverty remains significantly higher among Latinos, 
African Americans, Asians, and other racial groups than 
among Non-Hispanic Whites. Latinos’ odds of poverty are 
1.340 times those of Non-Hispanic Whites [95% CI: 
(1.252, 1.434)]; African Americans’ odds are 1.766 times 
those of Non-Hispanic Whites [95% CI: (1.680, 1.857)]; 
Asians’ odds are 1.278 times those of Non-Hispanic 
Whites [95% CI: (1.152, 1.417)]; and other racial groups’ 
odds are 1.504 times those of Non-Hispanic Whites [95% 
CI: (1.381, 1.638)]. Overall, the intercept variance, ߬̂00, 
was reduced from 0.249 (unconditional model) to 0.030 
after all individual, household, and LMA predictors were 



 

 

included in the model, corresponding to an 88 percent 
variance reduction. 

Finally, Model 10 treats the intercept and the coeffi-
cients that describe the racial-ethnic poverty gaps as 
random. In this model, the racial-ethnic gaps are partially 
explained by LMA predictors. Most of the patterns de-
scribed in Model 9 remain the same in Model 10. The odds 
of poverty in nonmetropolitan areas are 1.159 times those 
in metropolitan households. The odds of poverty are also 
higher in economically disadvantaged LMAs and in those 
with relatively greater percentage of extractive and gov-
ernment industries. A one standard deviation increase in 
economic disadvantage increases the odds of poverty by 
about 13 percent [exp (0.033 * 3.62) – 1], while a one 
standard deviation increase in extractive and government 
industries increases the odds of poverty by 6 percent. In 
contrast, the odds of poverty are lower in LMAs with a 
greater proportion of low-wage manufacturing industries, 
high-wage manufacturing industries, and good jobs. A one 
standard deviation increase in low-wage manufacturing, 
high-wage manufacturing industries, and percentage of 
good jobs reduces the odds of poverty by 4 percent, 3 
percent, and 11 percent, respectively. The results in Model 
10 also show that a one standard deviation increase in 
immigrant concentration reduces the odds of poverty by 5 
percent, while a one standard deviation increase in residen-
tial stability reduces the odds of poverty by 10 percent. 

In addition, the results in Model 10 reveal that Latinos, 
African Americans, Asians, and other racial groups remain 
more likely than Non-Hispanic Whites to be poor after all 
individual and LMA predictors are included. First, the 
odds of poverty for Latinos are about 26 percent higher 
than those of Non-Hispanic Whites. However, this poverty 
gap between Latinos and Non-Hispanic Whites narrows in 
LMAs with relative greater residential stability. Second, 
African Americans’ odds of poverty are about 85 percent 
higher than those of Non-Hispanic Whites, but this gap 
narrows in LMAs with a relative increase in economic 
disadvantage and widens in LMAs with a disproportionate 
share of lower-wage manufacturing industries. Third, 
Asians’ odds of poverty are about 14 percent higher than 
those of Non-Hispanic Whites; the Asian-White gap in 
poverty is reduced in LMAs with relative greater residen-
tial stability. Finally, the results in Model 10 reveal that 
other racial groups’ odds of poverty are about 49 percent 
higher than those of Non-Hispanic Whites. 
 

Discussion and Conclusions 
 

This research highlights racial/ethnic differences in 
household poverty in the Midwest. The first question of 
concern focused on the effect of race/ethnicity on house-

hold poverty, comparing Latinos to other racial/ethnic 
groups in the Midwest. Household poverty significantly 
differs by race/ethnicity, with racial minorities dispropor-
tionately overrepresented in the lower levels of the social 
hierarchy. Drawing on the results in Table 4, Latinos are 
almost 3 times as likely as Non-Hispanic Whites to be 
poor; African Americans 4 times; Asians 1.5 times; and 
other racial groups 3 times. Household poverty not only 
varies by race/ethnicity, but also by gender. Female-
headed households, particularly African American female-
headed households, are most likely to be in poverty. 

The second research question focused on the associa-
tion between race/ethnicity and household poverty while 
accounting for known confounding factors, such as edu-
cational attainment, household structure, and industry of 
employment and job quality. First, less-educated house-
holders are more likely to be poor. Second, single-headed 
households, especially never-married-female–headed 
households, are more likely than households headed by 
married couples to be in poverty. Finally, householders 
who were employed in high-wage manufacturing indus-
tries were the least likely to be in poverty, followed by 
those in high-wage services, low-wage manufacturing, and 
distributional services. At the other end of the spectrum, 
householders employed in agriculture, fishing, and forestry 
industries were more likely than those in consumer ser-
vices to be in poverty. This implies that jobs in the service 
sector, including both high-wage services and consumer 
services, are not equivalent substitutes for traditional high-
wage jobs in manufacturing that offer better pay. Latinos 
and other minorities, women, and immigrants—especially 
those with lower educational skills—tend to concentrate in 
secondary labor markets that offer lower-skill, part-time, 
intermittent, and low-paying jobs with little opportunity 
for upward mobility. 

Consistent with previous studies on poverty, educa-
tional attainment, household structure, employment indus-
try, and job quality predictors partially explain household 
poverty and the gaps in household poverty among racial/ 
ethnic groups. While improving the educational skills of 
Latinos and African Americans is likely to improve their 
employment opportunities and incomes, it may help to 
examine the barriers that keep them from primary labor 
markets even when they have positive human capital 
characteristics. Creating better-paying jobs equivalent to 
those in high-wage industries is crucial to the financial 
well-being of families. Households headed by single 
females, especially never-married singles, are significantly 
more likely to be poor. Therefore, creating better employ-
ment opportunities for women and supplementing their 
incomes, especially if they are the only earner in the 
household, are paramount. 



 

 

The third research question focused on the association 
between nonmetropolitan/metropolitan LMAs and house-
hold poverty, controlling for individual and household 
predictors. Findings show that household poverty rates 
vary significantly by LMA, ranging from 5 percent to 33 
percent (see Table 3). Despite the fact that individual/ 
household characteristics explain much of the variance in 
poverty between LMAs, much more of the variance is 
accounted for by labor market characteristics, especially 
structural characteristics and labor market opportunity 
structures. As expected, this study demonstrates that 
poverty is higher in nonmetropolitan than in metropolitan 
areas, suggesting that economic restructuring has placed 
greater burdens on nonmetropolitan households than on 
metropolitan ones. This suggests that to alleviate poverty it 
is imperative to address LMA predictors, including creat-
ing quality employment opportunities in the rural Midwest. 

In addition, economically disadvantaged LMAs—likely 
to be concentrated in metropolitan areas—are associated 
with higher poverty rates. Racial/ethnic minorities tend to 
live in these LMAs. Economic restructuring hit these com-
munities hardest, with loss of manufacturing jobs and the 
flight of middle-class families (Wilson, 1987 & 1996). 
Minorities who lost those manufacturing jobs were not 
able to secure comparably paying jobs in the restructured 
economy due to limited education levels. In addition, the 
flight of the middle class produced inner-city environ-
ments with limited tax bases and reduced social resources. 
These areas have higher unemployment rates, a higher 
proportion of less-skilled workers, higher proportions of 
African Americans and single-headed households with 
children, and a greater proportion of families relying on 
public assistance for survival. Residents in these commu-
nities not only have less access to better employment 
opportunities but are also socially isolated. 

Not surprisingly, this study also shows that immigrant-
concentrated and residentially stable LMAs are associated 
with lower poverty rates. Residents in these LMAs tend to 
have higher skill levels, access to employment opportuni-
ties, and social capital, and therefore have better opportu-
nities for higher incomes and, consequently, lower poverty 
rates. Much of the variance in poverty among LMAs is 
accounted for by these socio-demographic and structural  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

characteristics. This implies that addressing the uneven 
spatial access to opportunities, especially in forgotten 
places, may significantly address poverty and income 
inequalities of many families. This can be addressed with 
better economic development plans focusing on reinvest-
ing in these communities and creating better and long-
lasting job opportunities. 

The fourth research question focused on the effect of 
LMA opportunity structures—both industry structure and 
percentage of good jobs—on household poverty. Accord-
ing to these findings, a higher ratio of core industries to 
peripheral industries in an LMA reduces poverty. More 
specifically, LMAs with a relatively higher proportion of 
extractive, government, and consumer service industries 
are associated with higher poverty rates. In contrast, LMAs 
with a greater proportion of low-wage and high-wage 
manufacturing are associated with lower poverty rates. 
Furthermore, LMAs with a higher proportion of good jobs 
(i.e., greater proportion of residents in managerial, pro-
fessional, and technical occupations and in higher-wage 
services) are associated with lower poverty rates. Not 
surprisingly, these labor market opportunity structure 
indicators plus nonmetropolitan/metropolitan residence 
explain about 51 percent of the between-LMA variance in 
poverty. This suggests that the creation of higher-wage 
jobs in LMAs and a relatively even distribution of those 
job opportunities across different communities should be a 
priority. This must be concomitant, of course, with on-the-
job training and workforce development programs so that 
residents with fewer skills might have a chance to fill these 
positions as they are created. 

Finally, this study shows that, even after accounting for 
individual, household, nonmetropolitan/metropolitan 
location and LMA opportunity structure and structural 
characteristics, racial/ethnic minorities remain dispropor-
tionately disadvantaged in terms of household poverty. 
This suggests that there are other factors not accounted for 
that may explain the persistent gaps in poverty rates. 
Future research should focus on other structural barriers 
that reproduce poverty and household income inequalities 
among racial/ethnic minorities, different sources of house-
hold income for racial/ethnic minorities, and community 
development in forgotten places. 
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